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As of my last knowledge update in January 2022, the specific details 
and requirements for a visa application can change, so it's essential to 
check the latest information Indian Visa Application on the official 
website of the Indian embassy or consulate in Hungary or the official 
website for Indian visa applications. Here is a general guideline on how 
you can apply for an Indian visa online: 
 
 

 
 
 
Visit the Official Website: Start by visiting the official website for Indian 
visa applications. This is usually the website of the Indian embassy or 
consulate in Hungary. 
 
 
Create an Account: Many online visa application systems require you to 
create an account. Provide the necessary details to create your 
account. 
 

https://www.india-visa-online.org/hu/visa/


 
Fill in the Application Form: Complete the visa application form with 
accurate and up-to-date information. This form usually includes 
personal details, passport information, travel itinerary, and other 
relevant information. 
 
 
 
Upload Required Documents: Scan and upload the required supporting 
documents, such as a copy of your passport, passport-sized 
photographs, proof of travel arrangements, proof of accommodation, 
and any other documents specified by the visa application guidelines. 
 
 
 
Pay the Visa Fee: Pay the visa application fee using the accepted 
payment methods. The fee amount may vary depending on the type of 
visa and other factors. 
 
 
 
Schedule an Appointment: Some visa applications may require you to 
schedule an appointment at the embassy or consulate for an in-person 
interview or document verification.indian visa online Follow the 
instructions provided on the website to schedule any necessary 
appointments. 
 
 
Submit the Application: After completing the online application and 
uploading the required documents, submit your application through 
the online system. 
 
 

https://www.india-visa-online.org/hu/visa/


Track Your Application: Many visa application systems provide a 
tracking feature that allows you to monitor the status of your 
application. Use this feature to check the progress of your visa 
application. 
 
 
 
Collect Your Visa: Once your visa application is approved, follow the 
instructions to collect your visa. This may involve visiting the embassy 
or consulate in person. 
Remember that these steps are general guidelines, and the specific 
requirements and procedures may vary. Always refer to the official 
website of the Indian embassy or consulate for the most accurate and 
up-to-date information on visa applications for Hungarian citizens. 
 


