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Exceptional Keto​ ​your emotions. If a driver overtakes you on the wrong side, or pulls out of a 
side road in front of you, don't seethe with rage and honk your horn; You're hurting no one but 
yourself by raising your blood pressure. Anger has been linked to heart disease, and research 
has suggested that hardening of the arteries occurs faster in people who score highly in hostility 
and anger tests. Stay calm in such situations, and feel proud of yourself for doing so. Take 
comfort in the knowledge that such aggressive drivers only increase their own blood pressure. 
Your passengers will be more impressed with your "cool" than with your irascibility. 

 
 
If you are in a constant rush, feeling that every second of your life counts, just slow down a little. 
Yes, every second does count, ​Exceptional Keto​ but consider the concept of quality of life. 
Compare how you feel when you're in a hurry with how you feel when you're not. Which feels 
better? Rushing everywhere increases your stress level. The body tries to overcome stress by 
making certain physiological adjustments. Some time after you slow down, the physiological 
adjustments and the stress symptoms revert to normal. 
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If you don't ever slow down, the physiological adjustments and the stress symptoms persist. It is 
this persistence of the body's response that matters. You may develop physical, physiological or 
psychological problems, and may not be ​Exceptional Keto​ able to lead a normal life. Many 
cases of stress are somehow connected with money, or rather the lack of it. Such people 
struggle to make ends meet or to acquire more material possessions. This brings us to our final 
discussion: attitude. 
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It is always pleasant to enjoy the fruits of our labours, of course. Sometimes, however, it seems 
that whatever we do, it's just not enough to be able to afford that new car or that foreign holiday. 
So, what do we usually do then? We work harder, longer; we increase the stress on our minds 
and bodies; we spend less time with our families and friends; we become more irascible and 
less likeable people. If you find yourself in this situation, just stop for a moment, and consider: Is 
it all worth it? What is the purpose of life? Surely it is to be happy.  

 
You'll probably be happier if you adopt the philosophy that true quality of life is not to be found in 
material things. If you convince yourself that you want less, you'll need less. If you need less, 
you'll cope with life more easily, and the ​Exceptional Keto​  ​happier, and therefore healthier, 
you'll be. Buddha called this "enlightenment". Enjoy a "good-health attitude". Focus on your 
abilities instead of disabilities. Be satisfied with what you have, rather than be dissatisfied about 
what you don't have and probably never will have. 
 
Exceptional Keto​ you simply cannot cope with a healthy diet, exercise and emotional control, 
but genuinely prefer to eat junk food, be permanently drunk, be under constant stress, and be 
disliked by others, then enjoy your life while it lasts, but understand that the trade-off is that it 
will probably not last long. If you accept this willingly, you'll be happy. There is some merit in the 
philosophy that it is better to live a short, happy life than a long, miserable one. 
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Personal or individual health is largely subjective. For most individuals and for many cultures, 
however, health is a philosophical and subjective concept, associated with contentment, and 
often taken for granted when all is going well. The evidence that behavioural factors such as 
diet, physical activity, smoking and stress influence health is overwhelming. Thus, health is 
maintained and improved not only ​Exceptional Keto​ ​ through the advancement and application 
of health science, but also through the efforts and intelligent lifestyle choices of the individual 
and society. Perhaps the best thing you can do for your health is to keep a positive attitude. 
Optimal health can be defined as a balance of physical, emotional, social, spiritual and 
intellectual health. Maintain a positive attitude! 
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